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From day to night, lightness and darkness, everything is made of 

opposites and differences making everything unique. Being unique makes the 
world even more diverse, making communities explore differences, 
opportunities, and becoming social to others no mat ter how they may look. One 
way that I see uniqueness is through the lines in the movie Wonder when 
August mom says the quote, “you can’t blend in when you were born to stand 
out.” Aggie’s mom is explaining that even if your appearance may seem 
different, y ou're unique, bold and special in your own way. She’s also telling 
Auggie that he may look different, but he was born to stand out.  
 
 Uniqueness is a position where someone or something is unlike anything 
else in comparison. When used in relation to human s, it is often in relation to a 
person's personality, or some specific characteristics of it, signaling that it is 
unlike the personality traits that are prevalent in that individual's culture. 
Everyone is born with uniqueness, it's not something that you gain or control as 
you get older, it's part of you. Being unique defines who you are and expresses 
you a positive way. Without a sense of uniqueness, you will never feel satisfied 
and always very perturbed.  
 
 Just remember that you have alway be born to s tand out and be different, 
that's why we all don’t share the same looks, hobbies and culture. We were all 
created differently and uniquely making us who we are. If we never experienced 
any kind of uniqueness, the world would be bland, boring and not exciti ng so be 
proud that you were born with a purpose of uniqueness and never doubt 
yourself about looks, interest and capability. We will stand together, believe 
together and show importance to each other even if it may be hard… we are our 
own!  
 
 
 

 
 


